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Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000

Thank you for your request for further clarification on the response the Trust provided in relation to your initial FOI request for information in relation to translation and interpreting spending information at Velindre University NHS Trust.

Your Request and the Velindre University NHS Trust response is shown below;

1. For 2015/2016 and 2016/2017, no data was supplied for interpreting spending. Can you please clarify if a) the spending was nil; b) the data is not available/not recorded, or c) it is included in the translation spending.
The data is not available/not recorded.
1. Can you please clarify whether the interpreting spending includes British Sign Language (BSL)? If yes, do you have any data on the separate BSL spending that I could subtract from these totals?
No, not included.
1. The languages also mention Welsh. Do you have any data on the separate Welsh spending (for both written and oral)?
No, data provided in our original response covers all spending. Where Welsh translation is required this would be written translation. We don’t require Oral interpreting services for Welsh as we have a number of employees who are welsh speakers.
Should you not be satisfied with the information supplied or the process of supplying it, you have a right to complain and request a review.  You should forward your complaint to:-

Mr Stuart Morris
Assistant Director of Informatics
Velindre NHS Trust
2, Charnwood Court
Heol Billingsley
Parc Nantgarw
Cardiff / Caerdydd
CF15 7QZ
Tel / Ffon - 029 20196161
 
Should you wish to take your complaint further, if you are still unhappy with the decision after review, you can contact the:-
 
Information Commissioner's Office - Wales 
2nd Floor,
Churchill House,
Churchill Way,
Cardiff,
CF10 2HH
Telephone: 029 2067 8400
fax: 029 2067 8399
email: wales@ico.gsi.gov.uk

Yours sincerely



Julie Mann
Communication and Compliance officer
Velindre NHS Trust
2 Charnwood Court
Heol Billingsley
Parc nantgarw
Cardiff
CF15 7QZ	

Mae’r Ymddiriedolaeth yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg 
[image: ] This Trust welcomes correspondence in Welsh
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